
2020-2021 BID ON SCIENCE MATERIALS SCHOOL DISTRICT OF THE CITY OF ERIE, PA

Item # QTY                        Unit Item Description
AWARD UNIT 

PRICE

AWARD TOTAL 

PRICE

VENDOR 

AWARD
VENDOR INFORMATION

#1 40 Set
Animal Studies                                       Living Materials 

Order Forms  3 Coupon/Form Set
$0.00 No Bid

#2 42 Set
Environments                                                Living 

Materials Order Forms 3 coupon/Form Set
$0.00 No Bid

#3 5 Each
Organisms—From Macro To Micro  Living Materials 

Order Form  for Shipment 1 Shipment 1 (Wow bugs)
$0.00 No Bid

#4 2 Set
Organisms—From Macro To Micro  Living Materials 

Order Forms 5 coupon/Form Set Full Set
$0.00 No Bid

#5 4 Each
Populations & Ecoystems                            Living 

Materials Order Form  for Shipment 1 Shipment 1 

(Milkweed bugs)

$0.00 No Bid

#6 1 Each
API Stress Coat Water Conditioner, for Aquarium 5 

Gallons
$0.00 No Bid

#7 3 Pack
Connaisseur # 4 Cone White Coffee Filters, 400 

Count Pack
$31.20 $93.60 Metco

#8 7 Pack Crayola 12 Count Black Original Bulk Markers $0.00 No Bid

#9 7 Pack Crayola 12 Count Green Original Bulk Markers $0.00 No Bid

#10 3 Pack
EXPO Vis-A-Vis Wet-Erase Overhead Transparency 

Markers, Fine Tip, Blue, 12-Count
$24.59 $73.77 Metco

#11 80 Each MERIT PRO 03055 4" Plastic Putty Knife $1.44 $115.20 Metco

#12 4 Each
NOAA Weather Alert Radio, Portable AM/FM Battery 

Operated Transistor Radio with Headphone Jack, 
Best Reception, Digital Clock, LCD Display, Pocket 

$0.00 No Bid

#13 3 Pack
Scotch-Brite ocelo Handy Sponge, Assorted Colors, 

40 Sponges
$34.40 $103.20 Metco

#14 5 Pack
The Original Slinky Brand Metal Slinky 3 Pack , 

Package may vary
$19.80 $99.00 Metco

#15 40 Pack Bean, Kidney, Red, Pack of 60 $10.64 $425.60 Fisher Offer- Carolina Biological 1lb- S07536ND

#16 5 Pack Bottle, Dropper, plastic; 10 mL, Pack of 48 $17.66 $88.30 Fisher

#17 3 Pack Bottle, Square Glass, 240 mL, with Lid, Pack of 8 $0.00 No Bid

#18 12 Pack
Container, Plastic, 120 mL (4 oz), with Screwtop Lid, 

Pack of 16
$14.23 $170.76 Fisher Offer- Dynalon Products sold as 12/pk- S63382

#19 12 Each Corn, Field, 1/2 lb $4.93 $59.16 Fisher Offer- Fisher Scientific 8 oz pack-S041268

#20 12 Pack Cotton Swab, Pack of 500 $11.16 $133.92 Fisher Offer- Puritan Medical 200/pack- 22-025-250

#21 40 Pack
Crayon, Pack of 6 , blue, green, brown, orange, gold 

and black
$0.89 $35.60 Fisher Offer- Crayola 8/pack- S98367

#22 40 Pack
Dot, Variety of Colors, Pack of 32, yellow, red, white, 

blue
$0.00 No Bid

#23 40 Pack Fabric, White, 4 x 6 in, Pack of 31 $0.00 No Bid

#24 12 Each Fertilizer, All-Purpose, Water Soluble, 20-20-20, 8 oz $8.45 $101.40 Metco

#25 25 Each Graduated Cylinder, Polypropylene, 10 mL $1.47 $36.75 Fisher Offer- Dynalon Products S32800

#26 12 Each Graduated Cylinder, Polypropylene, 100 mL $2.77 $33.24 Fisher Offer- Dynalon Products S32803

#27 25 Each Graduated Cylinder, Polypropylene, 250 mL $1.78 $44.50 Fisher Offer- Eisco Scientific S14111

#28 30 Each Graduated Cylinder, Polypropylene, 50 mL $1.96 $58.80 Fisher Offer- Dynalon Products S32802

#29 12 Each Hay, 8 x 10-in Bag $0.00 No Bid

#30 30 Each Humus, Carolina®, 11-lb Bag $0.00 No Bid

#31 3 Each Inflating Pump $0.00 No Bid

#32 5 Pack
Magnet, Ring, Pack of 8, 8mm thick and 36 mm in 

diameter; center hole is 18 mm in diameter
$8.72 $43.60 Fisher Offer- Science First 16/pack- S52173

#33 40 Pack
Marker, dry erase, Pack of 4; orange, blue, brown 

and green
$3.60 $144.00 Metco

#34 3 Pack
Microchemistry Pipets, Super Jumbo, Overall Length 

12", Capacity 23.0 mL, Pack of 10
$0.00 No Bid

#35 12 Each Nitrile Disposable Gloves, Medium, Box of 100 $7.20 $86.40 Metco

#36 60 Each Pan, Fluted, Clear Plastic, 20 x 16 x 7 cm $0.00 No Bid

#37 12 Each Peridotite, Olivine (labeled "A"),                   Bag of 1 $1.65 $19.80 Fisher Offer- Eisco -S24706

#38 20 Pack Seed, Lima, Bush Bean, 1/2 lb $10.64 $212.80 Fisher Offer-sold as 1 lb- Carolina Biological S07531ND

#39 40 Pack Seed, Sunflower, Pack $0.00 No Bid

#40 40 Pack Seed, Sunflower, Pack of 60 $11.62 $464.80 Fisher Offer-sold as 1 lb-Carolina Biological S07539ND

#41 20 Pack Standard Seed, Wisconsin Fast Plants®, Pack of 200 $29.63 $592.60 Fisher Offer- Brassica Quick Plant Seeds 200/pk-Edvotek S05697

#42 10 Pack Slide, Glass Concavity, Student-Quality, Pack of 12 $42.26 $422.60 Fisher Offer- New Erie Scientific- 12-560A

#43 10 Pack Slide, Well, Plastic, Pack of 16 $0.79 $7.90 Fisher Offer- 10/pack- United Scientific Supplies-S07365

#44 40 Each Utility Funnel, 2  3/4", each, polypropelene $1.00 $40.00 Metco

#45 3 Pack
Vial with Screw-Top Dropper, 30 mL, brown glass 

dropper bottle; Pack of 16
$22.43 $67.29 Fisher Offer-12/pack- 30mL-DWK Life Sciences- S31683
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#46 50 Pack Water Mat, pack of 3 $0.00 No Bid

#47 40 Pack Wick, Pack of 144 $0.00 No Bid

#48 16 Pack boxes, sound and odor, with lid (2/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#49 40 Each Brine shrimp eggs, 6 g/vial $9.77 $390.80 Fisher Offer- sold as 1oz- Carolina Biological S07233ND

#50 20 Each Clay, ceramic, 2.3 kg/bag (5 lb.); white air dry $0.00 No Bid

#51 10 Set Coding dots, adhesive, set (39 sheets / set, 5 colors) $0.00 No Bid

#52 140 Pack Corn seeds $0.00 No Bid

#53 12 Pack
Pieces of plastic tubing, flexible, 10-cm (4 inches) 

(package of 40)
$0.00 No Bid

#54 12 Pack
Pieces of plastic tubing, flexible, 45-cm (18 inches) 

(package of 10)
$0.00 No Bid

#55 12 Pack Pipes, long, rigid plastic, clear, 10-cm (18/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#56 12 Pack
Pipes, short, rigid plastic, 7.5 cm (3 inches) (package 

of 18)
$0.00 No Bid

#57 6 Each poster, Body and Senses $0.00 No Bid

#58 4 Each Pre-K Discovery Guide, Body and Senses $0.00 No Bid

#59 60 Pack Radish seeds $7.64 $458.40 Fisher Offer- sold as 4oz- Fisher Scientific S041484 

#60 3 Pack Rocks, basalt (dark gray) (72/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#61 3 Pack Rocks, scoria (reddish) (72/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#62 3 Pack Rocks, tuff (yellowish) (72/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#63 12 Pack Seeds, Alfalfa, 4 oz. $6.99 $83.88 Fisher Offer- Carolina Biological -S07524ND 

#64 80 Pack Seeds, barley, (600/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#65 40 Pack Seeds, clover (1000/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#66 150 Pack Seeds, pea (100/pkg.) $0.00 No Bid

#67 12 Pack Seeds, Rye Grass, 4 oz. $2.62 $31.44 Fisher Offer- Fisher Scientific -S041394

#68 12 Pack Seeds, Sunflower, raw, shelled, 7 oz. $0.00 No Bid

#69 12 Pack Seeds, Wheat, 2 oz. $10.87 $130.44 Fisher Offer- sold as 1 lb- Carolina Biological S07540ND

#70 4 Pack
50 Knex Tan Interlocking Clip Wheel End - K'nex 

Special Part
$0.00 No Bid

#71 1 Pack
Knex Green 3/4" Standard Short Rods Bulk K'Nex 

Replacement Pieces - Lot of 300
$0.00 No Bid

#72 2 Set
Bulk Digital Up/Down                            Student 

Timers;  100 Pcs
$0.00 No Bid

#73 10 Pack
Business Source Adding Machine Paper Rolls, 2-1/4 

x 150 Foot, Pack of 12, White
$13.80 $138.00 Metco

#74 40 Each
Round toothpick, box 800 (must be round NOT 

FLAT)
$1.10 $44.00 Metco

#75 3 Pack
School Smart Non-Toxic Quick-Drying Water 

Resistant Permanent Marker, 1.0 mm Fine Tip, 

Black, Pack of 48

$21.60 $64.80 Metco

#76 2 Carton 10 x 12" 2 Mil Reclosable Bags; 1,000 bags/ Carton $86.99 $173.98 Fisher

#77 2 Carton 10 x 12" 4 Mil Reclosable Bags; 1,000 bags/ Carton $150.04 $300.08 Fisher

#78 2 Carton 6 x 6" 2 Mil Reclosable Bags; 1,000 bags/ Carton $37.00 $74.00 Fisher

#79 2 Carton 6 x 9" 2 Mil Reclosable Bags; 1,000 bags/ Carton $31.28 $62.56 Fisher

#80 100 Pack ACCO Economy Paper Clips, 1 Box- 100/Clips  $0.80 $80.00 Metco

#81 10 Pack
Aqua-Tech EZ-Change Replacement #3 Aquarium 

Filter Cartridge, 6 pack
$0.00 No Bid

#82 1 Case
Buy Bulk: Scotch Transparent Tape in Hand 
Dispenser, 1/2'' x 450'', Clear,(Case of 144)

$0.00 No Bid

#83 1 Pack
Pack of 10: GAS LIGHTERS 11" Refillable Butane 

BBQ Kitchen Fireplace Grill Utility
$0.00 No Bid

#84 40 Pack
Scotch Gift Wrap Tape 3 Pack, Clear, 3/4 in. x 300 in., 

3 Dispensers/Pack
$0.00 No Bid

#85 4 Each
Tetra Aquarium Whisper, 20-40 Gallon Internal 

Power Filter
$0.00 No Bid

#86 60 Pack
Rayovac ALAA-8J Ultra Pro Industrial AA Alkaline 

Batteries - 8/Pack
$0.00 No Bid

#87 60 Pack
Rayovac ALAAA-8J Ultra Pro Industrial AAA Alkaline 

Batteries - 8/Pack
$0.00 No Bid

#88 64 Pack
Rayovac ALD-12PPJ Ultra Pro Industrial D Alkaline 

Batteries - 12/Pack
$0.00 No Bid

#89 50 Each Attached Lid Container 22x15x12.8 $0.00 No Bid

#90 80 Each Attached Lid Container 27x17x12.5 $0.00 No Bid

TOTAL BID AWARD $5,806.97

Award to Fisher Scientific $4,623.60

Award to METCO $1,183.37

TOTAL AWARD $5,806.97


